Legal Supplement Part B—Vol. 64, No. 188—25th December, 2025 1949

LecAaL NorticE No. 474
REPUBLIC OF TRINIDAD AND TOBAGO
THE MOTOR VEHICLES AND ROAD TRAFFIC AcT, CHAP. 48:50
REGULATIONS

MADE BY THE MINISTER UNDER SECTION 100 OoF THE MOTOR VEHICLES
AND RoAD TRAFFIC ACT AND SUBJECT TO NEGATIVE RESOLUTION OF
PARLIAMENT

THE MOTOR VEHICLES AND ROAD TRAFFIC (AMENDMENT)
(NO.2) REGULATIONS, 2025

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Motor Vehicles and Road citation
Traffic (Amendment) (No.2) Regulations, 2025.

2. These Regulations come into effect on the 1st day of January, Commencement
2026.

3. In these Regulations, “the Regulations” means the Motor Vehicles Interpretation

and Road Traffic Regulations. Chap. 48:50
4. The Regulations are amended in— Regulation 14
and Sixth

(a) regulation 14, in paragraph (a), by deleting the words Schedule
“twenty dollars” and substituting the words “forty dollars”; amended

(b) the Sixth Schedule—

(i) in paragraph 7(a) by deleting the words
“$1,000.00” and substituting the words
“$2,000.007;

(i1) in paragraph 7(b) by deleting the words “$500.00”
and substituting the words “$1000.00”; and

(iii) in paragraph 7(c) by deleting the words “$300.00”
and substituting the words “$600.00”.

Made this 22nd day of December, 2025.

E. ZAKOUR
Minister of Transport and Civil Aviation

PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY THE GOVERNMENT PRINTER, CARONI
REPUBLIC OF TRINIDAD AND TOBAGO—2025





