
LEGAL NOTICE NO. 477 

REPUBLIC  OF  TRINIDAD  AND  TOBAGO 

THE MOTOR VEHICLES AND ROAD TRAFFIC ACT, CHAP. 48:50 

ORDER 

MADE BY THE PRESIDENT UNDER SECTION 14(5) OF THE  
MOTOR VEHICLES AND ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 

THE  MOTOR  VEHICLES  AND  ROAD  TRAFFIC  (AMENDMENT  
TO  THE  FOURTH  SCHEDULE)  ORDER,  2025 

1. This Order may be cited as the Motor Vehicles and Road Traffic 
(Amendment to the Fourth Schedule) Order, 2025. 

2. The Fourth Schedule to the Motor Vehicles and Road Traffic Act 
is amended– 

(a) by renumbering paragraph 8(1) as paragraph 8; 

(b) in paragraph 8 as renumbered– 

(i) by deleting the words “paragraph (1)” and 
substituting the words “paragraph 1”; and 

(ii) by deleting the words “three years” in both places 
where they occur and substituting in each place 
the words “eight years”; 

(c) in paragraph 9(1)– 

(i) by deleting the words “paragraph (l)” and 
substituting the words “paragraph 1”; and 

(ii) by inserting after the words “electric motor 
vehicle” in both places where they occur,  
the words “with a C.I.F. value not exceeding  
four hundred thousand dollars and”; 

(d) in paragraph 10, by deleting the words “paragraph (1)” in 
both places where they occur and substituting in each place 
the words “paragraph 1”; 

(e) in Appendix A– 

(i) in Part I, in item (10)(b), by deleting the words 
“three years” and substituting the words  
“eight years”; and 

(ii) by revoking Part II. 

Legal Supplement Part B—Vol. 64, No. 188—25th December, 2025 1955

Fourth 
Schedule 
amended 
Chap. 48:50

Citation



3. (1) Clause 2(a), (b), (c), (d) and (e)(i) shall come into effect on the 
1st day of January, 2026; and 

(2) Clause 2(e)(ii) shall come into effect on the 1st day of July, 
2026. 

 

Dated this 22nd day of December, 2025. 

C.  HEMLEE 
Secretary to Cabinet

PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY THE GOVERNMENT PRINTER, CARONI 
REPUBLIC OF TRINIDAD AND TOBAGO—2025

Commencement

1956 Motor Vehicles and Road Traffic (Amendment to the  
Fourth Schedule) Order, 2025


